
 LEGAL SUPPLEMENT 2243
to the Government Gazette of Mauritius No. 144 of 15 September 2021

Irfaan imac2/ Govt Notices 2021/ the Energy Efficiency (Registration of Energy Auditors) (Amend) Reg 2021 
15.09.2021 - 5th Proof MINs

Government Notice No. 235 of 2021

THE ENERGY EFFICIENCY ACT

Regulations made by the Minister under section 23 of 
 the Energy Efficiency Act

1. These regulations may be cited as the Energy Efficiency 
(Registration of Energy Auditors) (Amendment) Regulations 2021.

2. In these regulations –

“principal regulations” means the Energy Efficiency 
(Registration of Energy Auditors) Regulations 2016.

3. Regulation 5 of the principal regulations is amended –

(a) in paragraph (1), by deleting the words “2 years” wherever 
they appear and replacing them by the words “5 years”;

(b) in paragraph (2) –

(i) by deleting the words “2-year period” and replacing 
them by the words “5-year period”;

(ii) by deleting the words “3 non-residential buildings” 
and replacing them by the words “one 
non-residential building”;

(c) by adding the following paragraph –

  (3) An energy auditor who, prior to the coming into 
operation of these regulations, was initially registered for 
a period of 2 years, shall, on the coming into operation 
of these regulations, be deemed to have been registered 
for another period of 3 years from the expiry of the initial 
period of 2 years of registration.



2244 Government Notices 2021 

Irfaan imac2/ Govt Notices 2021/ the Energy Efficiency (Registration of Energy Auditors) (Amend) Reg 2021 
15.09.2021 - 5th Proof MINs

4. Regulation 6 of the principal regulations is amended –

(a) in paragraph (1), by deleting the words “paragraphs 
(2A) and (2D)” and replacing them by the words 
“paragraph (2A)”;

(b) by revoking paragraph (2D);

(c) in paragraph (4), by deleting the words “regulation 4(1) 
and the requirements specified in paragraph (2D)(a)(iii) 
or regulation 5(2)” and replacing them by the words 
“regulations 4(1) and 5(2)”;

(d)  in paragraph (6), by deleting the words “or (2D)(b)”;

(e) in paragraph (7), by deleting the words “or (2D)(b)”.

5. Regulation 8 of the principal regulations is amended, in 
paragraph (3), by deleting the words “, after a period of 12 months 
from the date of such deregistration”.

6. The Third Schedule to the principal regulations is amended by 
deleting the following words –

[Regulations 4(2), 6(2B), (2D) and (5), 7(2) and 8(3)]

and replacing them by the following words –

[Regulations 4(2), 6(2B) and (5), 7(2) and 8(3)]

7. These regulations shall come into operation on 16 September 
2021.

Made by the Minister on 10 September 2021.


